
TOWN OF HASTINGS, OSWEGO COUNTY, NEW YORK  

TOWN BOARD MEETING – JULY 9, 2024  

The Town of Hastings Town Board held a regular meeting on Tuesday, July 9th, at 7:30 PM. 

 

ATTENDANCE  

Board members present: Supervisor Tony Bush, Councilman Alan Hanson, Councilman John Hill, 
Councilman Mark Martino, and Councilman Richard Waldron.  

Also present: Jason Burns, Director of Code Enforcement and Community Planning and 
Development and Erin Goodrich, Town Clerk. 

Public present: Steve & Lisa Stevenson and John & Nancy DeBottis. 

 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIENCE  

Supervisor Bush called the town board meeting to order at 7:30 p.m. asked for the Pledge of 
Allegiance and pointed out the emergency exits. 

DISCUSSIONS 

Supervisor Bush opened the floor for public comment.  

There was no public comment or discussion.  

 

RESOLUTIONS:  

1.) Councilman Hanson introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

WHEREAS, the Town Board of the Town of Hastings has entered into an agreement with Edge Civil 
Corporation (“contractor”) for the completion of Town of Hastings Route 11 North/Fuller Road 
Water District Phase E Contract No. 4A – Pump Station General Construction;  

WHEREAS, the Work was substantially complete on October 15, 2022; 

WHEREAS, the Contractor was thereafter issued a Punch List; 

WHEREAS, the Town is retaining project funds from the Contractor to ensure successful project 
completion; 

WHEREAS, the Contractor subsequently completed said work and has reached Final Completion; 

WHEREAS, the Contractor has submitted an application for Final Payment and release of retained 
funds; and  



RESOLVED; the Town Board of the Town of Hastings authorizes payment to Edge Civil Corporation 
for the Work performed for Town of Hastings Route 11 North/Fuller Road Water District Phase E 
Contract No. 4A in the amount of the Final Payment Application.  

Councilman Martino seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Martino, aye; Councilman Waldron, 
aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. Motion carried. Resolution 24-80 adopted.  

2.) Councilman Martino introduced the following and moved its adoption: 

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the donation of $550.00 worth of services 
provided by David Bardoun Land Surveying for the new football field layout at VanLieu Park.   

Councilman Hill seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: Supervisor 
Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Martino, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and 
Councilman Hill, aye. Motion carried. Resolution 24-81 adopted.  

3.) Councilman Waldron introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the following: 

 A. Move for a Resolution to abolish the Highway Reserve GL account in the General Fund in 
the amount of $58,894.69. Unexpended funds ($58,894.69) will be transferred to the Parks Reserve 
in the General Fund. Per GML Section 6-d.  

Councilman Hanson seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Martino, aye; Councilman Waldron, 
aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. Motion carried. Resolution 24-82 adopted.  

4. ) Councilman Hill introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the minutes from the June 11th, 2024 Town 
Board Meeting.   

Councilman Martino seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Martino, aye; Councilman Waldron, 
aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. Motion carried. Resolution 24-83 adopted.   

5.) Councilman Hill introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves for the payment the claims certified on 
attached abstract #7 in the amounts indicated thereon.  

Councilman Waldron seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; Councilman Martino, aye; Councilman Hanson, 
aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. Motion carried. Resolution 24-84 adopted.  

 

6.) Councilman Hill introduced the following and moved its adoption:  



RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the 2024 Amendment to the Municipal 
Cooperative Agreement for the Greater Tompkins County Municipal Health Insurance Consortium 
(GTCMHIC). 

Councilman Martino seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Martino, aye; Councilman Waldron, 
aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. Motion carried. Resolution 24-85 adopted.  

ADJOURMENT  

Supervisor Bush asked again if there was anything new in the town or that the public wanted to talk 
about. No one responded, but he recalled some news he had, which was about the possibility of 
the racetrack in Brewerton going up for auction and potentially getting new owners. He feels new 
ownership could be a good move for the Town and will watch and see what happens with the 
auction moving forward, always keeping the Town’s interest in mind. As there was no further 
business after the brief discussion about the racetrack, Supervisor Bush motioned to adjourn the 
meeting. Councilman Waldron seconded. All in favor. Motion carried.  

The meeting adjourned at 7:37 pm.  

 

Respectfully submitted, 

 

Erin Goodrich, Town Clerk 

 


