
TOWN OF HASTINGS, OSWEGO COUNTY, NEW YORK  

PUBLIC HEARING FOR THE SPECIAL USE PERMIT FOR NANCY’S TOWING AND 
RECOVERY/HOWARD STRONG LOCATED AT 1371 US RT 11 HASTINGS, NY 13076. 

The Town of Hastings Town Board held a public hearing on Tuesday, August 13, 2024, to hear 
comments from the public regarding the special use permit for Nancy’s Towing and 
Recovery/Howard Strong.  

Board members present: Supervisor Tony Bush, Councilman Alan Hanson, Councilman John Hill, 
and Councilman Richard Waldron.  

Also present: John Martino, Codes Enforcement Officer; Michael Lewis, Highway Superintendent; 
and Erin Goodrich, Town Clerk.  

Not present: Councilman Mark Martino Sr.  

Supervisor Bush opened the public hearing at 7:26 pm to listen to any public comments and 
concerns to which there were none. The board had concerns over the special use permit because 
the property is not in compliance and therefore sent the permit back to the zoning board to look 
over again. The rest of the board agreed, and the special use permit will be sent back to the 
planning board. The resolution was pulled.  

Supervisor Bush closed the public hearing at 7:28 pm.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



TOWN OF HASTINGS, OSWEGO COUNTY, NEW YORK  

TOWN BOARD MEETING – August 13, 2024  

The Town of Hastings Town Board held a regular meeting on Tuesday August 13th at 7:30 pm.  

 

ATTENDANCE  

Board members present: Supervisor Tony Bush, Councilman Alan Hanson, Councilman John Hill, 
and Councilman Richard Waldron.  

Also present: John Martino, Codes Enforcement Office; Michael Lewis, Highway Superintendent; 
and Erin Goodrich, Town Clerk.  

Not present: Councilman Mark Martino Sr.  

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE   

Supervisor Bush called the town board meeting to order at 7:30 pm asked for the Pledge of 
Allegiance and pointed out the emergency exits.  

DISCUSSIONS  

Supervisor Bush opened the floor for public comment.  

1.) Tim Taylor, President of the Brewerton Ambulance, and he also works with the Brewerton Fire 
Department, spoke about his desire for us to set up a “tax district” within the Town to help support 
the costs of operating the Ambulance services. He provided a pie chart showing which towns they 
serve and how many calls they responded to within each town. In the year 2023 they responded to 
24 calls in Hastings and an additional 87 as back up. In the second quarter of this year, they took 15 
calls in the town of Hastings and were back up on 60. Mr. Taylor is looking for a $20,000 
commitment from the town without having to do a public referendum, which could call for a 
permanent tax created through a town wide vote. Supervisor Bush stated he would look into the 
matter and give it some thought. Mr. Taylor and Supervisor Bush  both spoke about how some new 
rules that OSHA might put through would hurt many ambulance and fire companies and the need 
for additional funding to these programs is becoming more prevalent.  

2.) Mike Oakes, a town resident who lives near the Dollar General being constructed on US Route 
11, explained that during the last heavy rain fall, water run off from the Dollar General site caused 
part of his driveway to wash out. Supervisor Bush asked if the site had any silt fencing up and was 
informed that the crew working on the store was adding it as the rain fell, in a slight panic. Bush 
asked Code Enforcement Officer John Martino to investigation the situation. Mr. Oakes also 
expressed concern over the noise the site creates throughout the day, explaining that his wife 
works from home and the noise adds stress and inconvenience to her workday. Martino explained 
the site is to be turned over in less than a month and the work will move to the interior of the 
building, essentially removing most of the noise issue. Martino tried to reassure Mr. Oakes that they 
are through the worst of the inconvenience of the construction and to have a little more patience  
it’s almost done.  



RESOLUTIONS:  

1.) Councilman Waldron introduced the following and moves its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the minutes from the July 9th, 2024, Town 
Board Meeting.  

Councilman Hill seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: Supervisor 
Bush, aye; Councilman Hill, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hanson, aye. 
Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-86 adopted.  

2.) Councilman Hanson introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves for the payment the claims certified on 
attached abstract #8 in the amounts indicated thereon.  

Councilman Waldron seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; and Councilman Hill, 
aye. Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-87 adopted.  

3.) Councilman Hanson introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the revisions to the “Town of Hastings Rt 
11 North/Fuller Rd WD Project”, Capital Project as administered through USDA Rural 
Development. The Town Board hereby modifies the following administrative budget items to the 
upcoming FINAL Form E #21: 

Councilman Hill seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: Supervisor 
Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. 
Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-88 adopted.  

4.) Councilman Hill introduced the following and moved its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town Board of the Town of Hastings hereby approves Amendment No. 6 of the 
September 11th, 2018, Engineering Agreement with Barton & Loguidice for the Route 11 North/Fuller 
Road Phase E Water Project in an amount not to exceed $9,689.29 for the additional construction 
administration.  

Councilman Waldron seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hill, 
aye. Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-89 adopted.  

5.) Councilman Hanson introduced the following and its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town Board of the Town of Hastings authorizes the Supervisor to develop an 
amended intermunicipal agreement with the village of Central Square for sewer service.  

Councilman Hill seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: Supervisor 
Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. 
Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-90 adopted.  



6.) Councilman Hill introduced the following and its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves FOX LOGGING for the lot clearing located 
off Barker Road Hastings, NY. Approximately 1 acre of woods are located off Barker Road, and said 
trees border the baseball fields which are located on 96.19 acres assigned to Tax ID #242.03-07-37. 
All trees will be cut and removed within the designated area. Per the procurement policy, three 
quotes were obtained, and Fox Logging was the lowest bidder.  

Councilman Waldron seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hill, 
aye. Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-91 adopted.  

7.) Councilman Hill introduced the following and its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board approves the monthly retainer with Cerio Law 
Offices, PLLC effective August 1st, 2024, at the monthly rate of $2,000 per month and naming Cerio 
Law Offices, PLLC as the Town’s Attorney with the acceptance of resignation of Anthony P. 
Rivizzigno the present town attorney.  

Councilman Waldron seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hill, 
aye. Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-92 adopted.  

8.) Councilman Waldron introduced the following and its adoption:  

RESOLVED, the Town of Hastings Town Board herby authorizes the publication for bids of the 
purchase of approximately 4,000-6,000 yards of sand for road sanding and said product shall be 
clean, sharp, coarse sand meeting the specifications for the State of New York DOT as applied to 
snow and ice control. This is for only the purchase and loading of sand, town will haul. The travel 
distance will be taken into consideration. Bids will be received by the Town Clerk located at 1134 
US Rt 11 Central Square, NY 13036 until 2:00pm September 6, 2024, at which time bids will be 
opened. The Town Board reserves the right to accept or reject any and all bids.  

Councilman Hill seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: Supervisor 
Bush, aye; Councilman Hill, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hanson, aye. 
Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-93 adopted.  

9.) Councilman Hill introduced the following and its adoption:  

RESOLVED, that the Town of Hastings Town Board shall direct the disbursement of $84,915.22 
from the Town of Hastings Route 11 North/Fuller Road Water District from USDA Rural 
Development and to Cerio Law Offices, PLLC to be held in escrow pending a final determination 
from the Department of Labor.  

Supervisor Bush seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: Supervisor 
Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Councilman Hill, aye. 
Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-94 adopted.  

10.) Supervisor Bush introduced the following and its adoption:  



RESOLVED, the Town Board of the Town of Hastings authorizes payment to Caldwell Tanks, Inc for 
the Work Performed for Town of Hastings Route 11 North/Fuller Road Water District Phase E 
Contract No. 3 in the amount of Payment Application No. 4; FURTHER RESOLVED, the Town of 
Hastings will hold the remaining retained funds in an Escrow Account with Cerio Law Firm until 
such time the NYSDOL resolves the open Labor Investigations Case ID #PW006 2023006423 and 
Case ID #PW06 2023006754.  

Councilman Waldron seconded. Supervisor Bush asked if there was any discussion. Vote: 
Supervisor Bush, aye; Councilman Hanson, aye; Councilman Waldron, aye; and Coucilman Hill, 
aye. Councilman Martino not present. Motion carried. Resolution 24-95 adopted.  

ADJOURMENT  

As there was no further business, Supervisor Bush motioned to adjourn the meeting. Councilman 
Waldron seconded. All in favor. Motion carried. 

The meeting adjourned at 8:04 pm.  

 

Respectfully submitted,  

 

 

Erin Goodrich, Town Clerk 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


